

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

50 Kennedy Plaza, Suite 1500

Providence, RI 02903

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (R6) 848712
Bill Date: 9 Nov 2010
Cut-Off Date: 31 Oct 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$12,304.00
Less: Discount	(\$7,412.30)

Fees Billed.	\$4,891.70
Total Disbursements.	\$108.30

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$5,000.00
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)848712
Bill Date: 9 Nov 2010Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
10-Sep-2010	Cull	Review documents from D. Ford.	1.80
20-Sep-2010	Cull	Review letters from D. Ford; liaise with D. Ford regarding meeting with Fuss & O'Neill.	1.30
21-Sep-2010	Cull	Prepare for and attend meeting with Fuss & O'Neill and D. Ford in Connecticut.	7.50
22-Sep-2010	Cull	Review documents and email from D. Ford.	0.80
13-Oct-2010	Cull	Review documents and reports produced by D. Ford.	4.70
19-Oct-2010	Cull	Finalize review of documents.	4.20
19-Oct-2010	Deschenes	Telephone call with Attorney Cull; brief review of contracts in advance of research assignment.	0.40
20-Oct-2010	Cull	Finalize draft opinion letter.	4.80
25-Oct-2010	Deschenes	Research for Attorney Cull relating to implied contract terms.	1.20
27-Oct-2010	Deschenes	Perform research for Attorney Cull; telephone conference with Attorney Cull regarding same.	2.20
28-Oct-2010	Cull	Liaise with Fuss & O'Neill; conference call with D. Ford; review memo prepared by D. Ford.	0.60
29-Oct-2010	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; review and respond to questions from D. Ford; review and comment on Fuss & O'Neill proposal.	0.70
Total Hours			30.20

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)848712
Bill Date: 9 Nov 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
09/23/10	Cash Disb. - CULL, RHIAN M.J. - Reimbursement for travel to Manchester, CT for meetings with client & engineers on 09/21/2010.	108.30
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$108.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)848712
Bill Date: 9 Nov 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Deschenes	3.80
Cull	26.40

	30.20

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 852352
Bill Date: 13 Dec 2010
Cut-Off Date: 30 Nov 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$672.00
Total Disbursements	\$1.56

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$673.56
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)852352
Bill Date: 13 Dec 2010Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
03-Nov-2010	Cull	Review Wright Pierce's proposal and emails from D. Ford; draft response email to D. Ford.	0.40
04-Nov-2010	Cull	Liase with Fuss & O'Neill and D. Ford.	0.30
18-Nov-2010	Cull	Traveling to and attending meeting in Wolfeboro. (No Charge)	0.00
30-Nov-2010	Cull	Review draft letter to NHDES and amend same; draft email to D. Ford.	0.90
		Total Hours	1.60

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)852352
Bill Date: 13 Dec 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
11/30/10	Duplicating	1.56
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$1.56

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)852352
Bill Date: 13 Dec 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	1.60

	1.60

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 855869
Bill Date: 20 Jan 2011
Cut-Off Date: 31 Dec 2010

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$1,386.00
Total Disbursements.	\$111.50

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$1,497.50
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)855869
Bill Date: 20 Jan 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
03-Dec-2010	Cull	Review revised letter, introduction to draft report and email from D. Ford.	0.60
06-Dec-2010	Cull	Review email from D. Ford regarding Wright Pierce; review email from D. Ford to Fuss & O'Neill.	0.40
07-Dec-2010	Cull	Review email from Fuss & O'Neill.	0.10
09-Dec-2010	Cull	Review email from D. Ford; review and comment on draft press release; conference call with D. Ford.	0.70
15-Dec-2010	Cull	Discussions with D. Ford regarding meeting with DES.	0.40
16-Dec-2010	Cull	Review email with documents and photos from D. Ford; liaise with D. Ford regarding contents.	0.50
20-Dec-2010	Cull	Review emails from D Ford and C Cullen.	0.40
23-Dec-2010	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford regarding meeting dates; review emails regarding meeting.	0.20
		Total Hours	3.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)855869
Bill Date: 20 Jan 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
12/16/10	Cash Disb. - CULL, RHIAN M.J. - Reimbursement for travel to town offices of Wolfeboro to meet with client on 11/18/2010.	111.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$111.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)855869
Bill Date: 20 Jan 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant

Total
Hours

Cull

3.30

3.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 858789
Bill Date: 16 Feb 2011
Cut-Off Date: 31 Jan 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$3,154.00
Total Disbursements	\$160.88

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$3,314.88

=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)858789
Bill Date: 16 Feb 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
07-Jan-2011	Cull	Review Fuss & O'Neill invoice; liaise with D Ford; review Memo from Fuss & O'Neill.	0.90
17-Jan-2011	Cull	Review emails from D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill.	0.30
18-Jan-2011	Cull	Prepare for and attend meeting with Fuss & O'Neill and D. Ford.	3.80
19-Jan-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford.	0.30
20-Jan-2011	Cull	Prepare for and attend meeting with Town of Wolfeboro and Wright-Pierce.	2.50
20-Jan-2011	Cull	(NON-BILABLE) Travel to meeting at Town of Wolfeboro	0.00
21-Jan-2011	Cull	Review proposal from SW Cole.	0.30
25-Jan-2011	Cull	Review Fuss & O'Neill invoice; liaise with D. Ford.	0.20
		Total Hours	8.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)858789
Bill Date: 16 Feb 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
01/27/11	Cash Disb. - PLAZA CATERING & DELI Fee for purchase of lunch for the R. Cull client meeting held on 01/18/2011.	49.88
01/28/11	Cash Disb. - CULL, RHIAN M.J. Reimbursement for travel expenses to Wolfeboro, NH for meeting with client on 01/20/2011.	111.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$160.88

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)858789
Bill Date: 16 Feb 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	8.30

	8.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 861763
Bill Date: 15 Mar 2011
Cut-Off Date: 28 Feb 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$1,710.00
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$1,710.00
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)861763
Bill Date: 15 Mar 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
10-Jan-2011	Cull	Review emails from D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill.	0.30
11-Jan-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill.	0.20
01-Feb-2011	Cull	Review comments from Fuss & O'Neill; review WP proposal and draft email with comments on same; review email from D. Ford regarding new breakout and answers to my previous comments; review further comment from Fuss & O'Neill.	0.90
02-Feb-2011	Cull	Discussions with with D. Ford regarding WP proposal.	0.30
11-Feb-2011	Cull	Review and comment on SW Cole proposal; review email from Fuss & O'Neill.	0.80
15-Feb-2011	Cull	Review and comment on WP proposal; draft email send to D. Ford regarding same.	1.20
17-Feb-2011	Cull	Review email from D. Ford and respond to same.	0.20
18-Feb-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford.	0.20
22-Feb-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford.	0.40
Total Hours			4.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)861763
Bill Date: 15 Mar 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	4.50

	4.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 864171
Bill Date: 13 Apr 2011
Cut-Off Date: 31 Mar 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$1,170.00
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$1,170.00

=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)864171
Bill Date: 13 Apr 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
04-Mar-2011	Cull	Draft letter to WP and liaise with D. Ford regarding same.	0.40
07-Mar-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; review D. Ford's comments on draft letter.	0.40
07-Mar-2011	Ferguson	Legal research regarding New Hampshire statute of limitations.	0.30
08-Mar-2011	Ferguson	Legal research regarding statute of limitations period in New Hampshire; email correspondence and conference with R. Cull in connection with the same; telephone conference with K. Verge, S. Pasakarnis and D. Deschenes in connection with the same.	0.50
09-Mar-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford; review letter regarding statute of limitations; review research regarding statute of limitations.	1.30
22-Mar-2011	Cull	Review invoice from Fuss & O'Neill and send to D. Ford; review emails from D. Ford and P. Forzley.	0.40
		Total Hours	3.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)864171
Bill Date: 13 Apr 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	2.50
Ferguson	0.80

	3.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 868034
Bill Date: 18 May 2011
Cut-Off Date: 30 Apr 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$304.00
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$304.00

=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)868034
Bill Date: 18 May 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
01-Apr-2011	Cull	Review draft report from Fuss & O'Neill.	0.80
		Total Hours	0.80

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)868034
Bill Date: 18 May 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	0.80

	0.80

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street

Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 878841
Bill Date: 15 Sep 2011
Cut-Off Date: 31 Aug 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$2,280.00
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$2,280.00

=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)878841
Bill Date: 15 Sep 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
27-Jul-2011	Cull	Review email and documents from D. Ford; respond to email.	0.30
28-Jul-2011	Cull	Review emails and attachments from D. Ford; conference call with D. Ford.	0.50
09-Aug-2011	Cull	Review and respond to email from D. Ford.	0.10
25-Aug-2011	Cull	Review materials provided by D. Ford; review emails with P. Forzley.	1.30
29-Aug-2011	Cull	Review and comment on draft response by SW Cole; review and send draft of public statement; prepare for and participate in conference call.	3.80
		Total Hours	6.00

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)878841
Bill Date: 15 Sep 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	6.00

	6.00

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street

Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 882289
Bill Date: 19 Oct 2011
Cut-Off Date: 30 Sep 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$9,490.00
Total Disbursements.	\$71.15

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$9,561.15
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)882289
Bill Date: 19 Oct 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
06-Sep-2011	Cull	Review and respond to email from D. Ford; prepare for meeting with D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill.	1.60
07-Sep-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford.	0.20
13-Sep-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford.	0.30
14-Sep-2011	Cull	Prepare for and attend meeting with D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill	4.90
15-Sep-2011	Cull	Review documents for report.	3.20
19-Sep-2011	Cull	Review documents for purpose of drafting reports.	3.10
21-Sep-2011	Cull	Identify legal issues to be issued in Report to Selectmen; review documents in preparation of drafting the report.	2.80
22-Sep-2011	Pasakarnis	Teleconference with Attorney Cull regarding case and research projects.	0.20
23-Sep-2011	Cull	Meeting with S. Pagakains; review documents for purpose of drafting report.	2.60
23-Sep-2011	Pasakarnis	Conference with Attorney Cull regarding research assignment and facts; research New Hampshire law regarding statute of limitations and standard of care for design professionals; begin drafting memorandum regarding same.	2.00
28-Sep-2011	Pasakarnis	Additional legal research regarding negligence claims in New Hampshire in the area of professional liability; research law regarding damages; draft memorandum to Attorney Cull regarding same.	1.20
29-Sep-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford; review research from S. Pasakarnis and review cases for purpose of drafting report.	3.40
29-Sep-2011	Pasakarnis	Finalize memorandum to Attorney Cull regarding New Hampshire law concerning statute of limitations, professional standard of care, and damages.	0.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)882289
Bill Date: 19 Oct 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Total Hours

26.00

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)882289
Bill Date: 19 Oct 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
09/21/11	Cash Disb. - PLAZA CATERING & DELI - Fee f purchase of lunch for R. Cull client meeting held on 09/14/2011.	71.15
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$71.15

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 5

Bill Number: (B1)882289
Bill Date: 19 Oct 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	22.10
Pasakarnis	3.90

	26.00

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street

Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 885278
Bill Date: 15 Nov 2011
Cut-Off Date: 31 Oct 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$5,016.00
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$5,016.00
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)885278
Bill Date: 15 Nov 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
04-Oct-2011	Cull	Review email from Fuss & O'Neill; draft email to Fuss & O'Neill; review email from D. Ford.	0.40
05-Oct-2011	Cull	Review research and documents for report.	1.40
12-Oct-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford.	0.20
24-Oct-2011	Cull	Review memo from Fuss & O'Neill; begin to draft memo to client.	2.60
25-Oct-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford and P. Forzley.	0.30
26-Oct-2011	Cull	Draft report to Town of Wolfeboro.	1.60
27-Oct-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; draft report.	3.30
28-Oct-2011	Cull	Draft emails to D. Ford; review notes of meeting with Wright-Pierce; review draft letter; finalize the draft report; conference call with D. Ford.	3.40
		Total Hours	13.20

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)885278
Bill Date: 15 Nov 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	13.20

	13.20

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 888236
Bill Date: 16 Dec 2011
Cut-Off Date: 30 Nov 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$12,720.00
Total Disbursements.	\$126.53

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$12,846.53
	=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)888236
Bill Date: 16 Dec 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
01-Nov-2011	Cull	Review Fuss & O'Neill invoice and provide to D. Ford; review additional questions from Board of Selectmen; liaise with D. Ford; review emails from NHDES to D. Ford; review correspondence and documents regarding internal operation of the RIB; extended conference call with D. Ford; discussions with S. Pasakarnis regarding client litigation in NH; prepare for meeting.	3.20
01-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Draft email to Attorney Cull regarding procedure for filing a lawsuit in New Hampshire and other filing and discovery considerations; exchange emails with Attorney Cull.	0.30
02-Nov-2011	Cull	Prepare for, travel to and attend meeting with the Board of Selectmen.	8.30
04-Nov-2011	Cull	Discussions with S. Pasakarnis; review draft budget.	1.10
04-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Teleconference with Attorney Cull regarding lawsuit, preparation of budget, and legal research regarding actions against Wright-Pierce; begin preparing litigation budget.	1.30
07-Nov-2011	Cull	Discussions with S. Pasakarnis regarding Wright Pierce; review draft budget.	0.80
07-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Draft litigation budget for various stages of litigation; research case law involving claims against Wright-Pierce; research case law regarding professional standard of care in New Hampshire; draft email to Attorney Cull regarding same.	2.50
08-Nov-2011	Cull	Amending budget and draft letter to D. Owen.	3.80
08-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Meeting with Attorney Cull regarding preparation of litigation and trial budgets; continue drafting extensive revisions to litigation budgets.	2.20

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)888236
Bill Date: 16 Dec 2011Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

09-Nov-2011	Cull	Finalizing budget.	1.30
09-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Extensive revisions to litigation budget; emails and teleconferences with Attorney Cull regarding same.	1.20
10-Nov-2011	Cull	Finalize budget and send to D. Ford.	0.40
10-Nov-2011	Pasakarnis	Review letter to Wolfeboro regarding budget and exchange emails with Attorney Cull regarding same.	0.20
15-Nov-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford.	0.10
16-Nov-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford; review of response to TCC; brief review of emails.	1.40
17-Nov-2011	Cull	Review and comment on Town's communications with Mr. Kasiewicz and draft email to D. Ford regarding same; review comments from D. Ford.	0.70
28-Nov-2011	Cull	Review draft Report from S.W. Cole.	3.20
29-Nov-2011	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; review and amend draft NHDES Report.	1.40
30-Nov-2011	Cull	Review revised SW Cole Report.	2.10
		Total Hours	35.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)888236
Bill Date: 16 Dec 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Disbursements:

Date	Description	Value
11/30/11	Postage	1.28
11/30/11	Online Research	8.75
11/04/11	Cash Disb. - CULL, RHIAN M.J. - Reimbursem for travel expenses to Town of Wolfeboro's library for Board of Selectmen meeting held on 11/02/2011.	116.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS:		\$126.53

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 5

Bill Number: (B1)888236
Bill Date: 16 Dec 2011

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	27.80
Pasakarnis	7.70

	35.50

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

28 State Street
Boston, Massachusetts 02109-1775

Town of Wolfeboro
David W. Ford, P.E.
9 Union Street
P.O. Box 629
Wolfeboro, NH 03894

Billing Attorney: 2194 Cull
Bill Number: (B1) 895138
Bill Date: 23 Feb 2012
Cut-Off Date: 31 Jan 2012

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

For Professional Services Rendered:

Total Fees	\$18,606.50
Total Disbursements	\$0.00

Total Fees and Disbursements	\$18,606.50

=====

Please Return A Copy Of This Page With Your Remittance.

Due upon Receipt, amounts outstanding for more than 45 days from the invoice date are subject to a late charge of 1% per month until payment is received.

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 2

Bill Number: (B1)895138
Bill Date: 23 Feb 2012Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Date	Attorney/ Legal Assistant	Description	Hours
05-Dec-2011	Cull	Review final report; liaise with D. Ford and Fuss & O'Neill.	2.60
07-Dec-2011	Cull	Review draft Tolling Agreement; review emails from Fuss & O'Neill; review email from D. Ford regarding costs; conference call with D. Ford.	1.40
07-Dec-2011	Pasakarnis	Legal research regarding enforceability of tolling agreements (tolling the statute of limitations); exchange emails with Attorney Cull regarding same.	1.10
09-Dec-2011	Cull	Review article from D. Ford.	0.30
12-Dec-2011	Cull	Review and comment on email; liaise with D. Ford; conference call with D. Ford.	0.90
13-Dec-2011	Cull	Review and comment on correspondence provided by D. Ford.	1.10
16-Dec-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford; review memo and regulations.	1.20
22-Dec-2011	Cull	Conference call with D. Ford; review and comment on memo from D. Ford; review and amend memo to BOS; conference call with D. Ford regarding same.	2.10
29-Dec-2011	Cull	Review proposal from Fuss & O'Neill.	1.40
03-Jan-2012	Cull	Review Fuss & O'Neill proposal and comment on same; liaise with D. Ford; conference with D. Ford.	1.30
09-Jan-2012	Cull	Review email from D. Ford; liaise with D. Ford; conference call with D. Ford.	1.30
11-Jan-2012	Cull	Review and comment on email from P. Atherton; liaise with D. Ford; review applicable regulations; conference call with D. Ford.	2.70
12-Jan-2012	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; conference call with D. Ford.	0.90
16-Jan-2012	Cull	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Wolfeboro and Fuss & O'Neill; review documents from D. Ford and comment on same.	2.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 3

Bill Number: (B1)895138
Bill Date: 23 Feb 2012Client: 064443 Town of Wolfboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

17-Jan-2012	Cull	Review email from D. ford and D. Owen; review letter from Wright Pierce and discuss same with D. Ford; conference call with S. Pasakarnis regarding drafting of Complaint.	1.40
17-Jan-2012	Pasakarnis	Research Wolfboro website for information regarding Wastewater Treatment facility and begin reviewing public documents concerning the Project to develop the Complaint.	2.50
18-Jan-2012	Cull	Liaise with D. Ford; conference call with D. Ford.	0.60
18-Jan-2012	Pasakarnis	Review contracts, reports, and other documents regarding the Rapid Infiltration System to prepare Complaint; begin drafting Complaint.	8.00
19-Jan-2012	Pasakarnis	Continue reviewing Project reports and continue drafting the Complaint.	4.30
23-Jan-2012	Cull	Review letter to Wright Pierce; conference call with S. Pasakarnis.	0.80
24-Jan-2012	Pasakarnis	Continue drafting Complaint against Wright Pierce and extensive review of contracts and engineering reports to develop the facts for the complaint.	8.00
25-Jan-2012	Cull	Review draft complaint.	2.30
25-Jan-2012	Pasakarnis	Continue revising draft Complaint against Wright Pierce.	3.50
27-Jan-2012	Cull	Amend draft Complaint.	2.30
Total Hours			54.30

HINCKLEY, ALLEN & SNYDER LLP

Page 4

Bill Number: (B1)895138
Bill Date: 23 Feb 2012

Client: 064443 Town of Wolfeboro
Matter: 0145130 Wright-Pierce

Summary of Hours Worked:

Attorney/Legal Assistant	Total Hours
Cull	26.90
Pasakarnis	27.40

	54.30